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Letters
to Santa

Dear Santa, 
I would like a Hot Wheels 
Super Ultimate Garage, Jetson 
Jupiter Scooter, Disney Cars 3, 
Florida Speedway, and most 
of all the NBA 2K18 game and 
a Playstation 4 plus. Thank 
you Santa! Clay Eaton, 6
Eric & Hannah Eaton
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
 I have been a good girl this 
year. Please bring me some 
LOL stuff, Legos, new clothes, 
purple converse, color chang-
ing sequin blanket, make-up, 
dolls, Shopkins and a bunch 
of blind bags. I love them. 
I will leave you a surprise 
under the tree. 
Raylee Webb, 6
Brad & Jennifer Hardy
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I have been good this year, 
and for Christmas if you could 
bring me a remote control 
car, games, and skateboard. 
And could you please help 
kids who are sick with new 
nerf guns.
Sincerely, Gavin Clem
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I would like to have a new 
paint station. I would like to 
have a walking teddy bear 
(Teddy Ruxpin) and some 
new play-doh new colors. I 
would also like to have bum-
ber cars for me and my little 
brother. Grace Rose, 6
Jim & Jean Rose
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I love you. I want a Hover-
board and nerf guns. And that 
is it. Kannon Sparks, 6
Michael & Sheila Sparks
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I would like a set of Bargbies, 
a sand castle. I would like 
some jewelry too. I will leave 
milk and cookies under the 
tree for you. I love you, Santa.
Kaldian, 6, Mechelle & Jeff
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
My name is Aiden King. I 
have been a good boy this 
year. For Christmas I would 
like a Hoverboard, a new 
green bike with a kickstand, 
a green remote control train, 
a gumball machine, some 
new clothes, and a new pair 
of sunglasses. I will leave you 
milk and cookies under the 
tree and oats for the reindeer. 
Have a safe trick.
Love, Aiden King, 7
Sammie & Chastity King
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I want 20 Slimmies and 3 
American girl dolls, and 20 
fake grasses, LOL bath bombs.
Kylie Noland, 6
Tyler Noland & Suzi Jones
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I want Nintendo Switch.
Branson, 6, Jason Carroll
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
My name is Kamryon. I’ve 
been a pretty good girl this 
year. I would like an I-pad, 
Barbie doll, and a baby doll 
that looks real. 3 or 4 pairs 
jeans, boots that go to your 
ankles. I want new dry erase 
markers for Mrs. Kelly. Tell 
Mrs. Santa I love her. I will 
leave milk and cookies.
Kamryon Johnson, 6
Wanda Johnson & Jerald 
Blythe
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
What I want for Christmas 
is a new toy buys and some 
Minecraft toys. I will leave 
you cookies by the tree.
Ayden Bebout, 6
Charles & Elizabeth Bebout
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I would like a gum ball 
machine, a race car set, new 
clothes, an iron man doll as 

well as an art set. Colby Tip-
ton, 6, Cassandra Stevens
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I think I’ve been pretty good 
or goof enough to get the 
stuff I want. I really want 
Hatchimals Colleggtibles and 
the Soggy Doggy game. I also 
want a Hatchimals Surprise, 
a JOJO Siwa doll with her dog. 
The thing I want the most is a 
bow and arrow from Wal-
mart. I would like to have a 
LOL surprise Fritz maker, 
JoJo siwa headphones, Bop It 
Maker, an Xbox with gamease, 
drum set, a drone, and Fin-
gerlings. There’s a lot more 
I want, but this stuff I really, 
really want! I love you Santa 
and I love Christmas. Thank 
you for bringing it to us.
Love, Lily Jo Estes, 6
Meagan Hoffman & Jeff Estes
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I would like to have a big 
Barbie doll house and a 
Barbie doll that has a bay. My 
brother would like a Nin-
tendo Switch with two games 
– Legend of Zelda and Mario 
Cart 8 Deluxe. We both have 
been very good this year at 
home and at school.
Julianna Brooks, 5
Johnny & Julie Brooks
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
Merry Christmas. Hope you 
are ready to eat lots of cook-
ies. I have worked hard to be 
a good boy this year. I would 
like trains, hot wheels garage, 
and a dirt bike, if Mommy will 
let you. Thanks.
Jordan Samples, 5
Justin and Jessica Samples
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I have been a good boy this 
year. I would like to have a 
gumball machine, a fidget 
spinner, a tractor and some 
cowboy boots. I love you.
Jared Addison, 5
Thomas & Brittany Addison
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
My name is Jacob Fowler. I 
have been good all year. For 
Christmas I would like for you 
to bring me Pokemon cards, 
board games, fidget spinners. 
Pease tell Daddy I love him.
Jacob, 5
Susan Stepp & Jimmy Fowler
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I’ve been trying really super 
hard to listen better. If you 
can AI’d like to have a tablet 
and one for my little sister 
Charley so she won’t want to 
use mine! I also want Disney 
Princess dolls, a race car tract 
set, an art set, a flip-a-zoo 
pillow and a stuffed animal of 
a reindeer and of you in your 
sleigh! Please let me know 
(before Christmas…). What 
kind of cookies do you want 
this year? Love you and hope 
you have a Merry Christmas 
too!  Laycee Newton 5 ½ 
Ryan & Angela Newton
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
For Christmas I want a puppy 
(a real one), easy bake oven, 
spirit horse, car seat for 
stuffed animal, microphone, 
tablet, Sandy the dog, puppy 
surprise, a real reindeer or 
a stuffed one, light up fidget 
spinner, a dog house big 
enough for her to fit inside, 
headphones, and a tablet.
Iris Patrick-Howard, 6
Rebecca Patrick-Howard
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I’ve been a good boy this year. 
I would like a lot of remote 
control cars, hot wheels, a 
pogo stick, and a skate board. 
Please bring Hayden some 
goodies too. I will leave you 
milk, coke and cookies under 
the tree. Thanks. Ty Brinegar, 
7 Stephanie Brinegar
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I want a mini pool table, a 
unicycle, a nerf gun, and a 
Lego batman set.
? Age 7 Jason & Amy Johnson
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
My name is Kaleah. I am eight 
years old. This year for Christ-
mas, I would like to have a 
new Baby Alive doll and a 
new pair of boots. I have been 
a very good girl this year! I 
will milk and cookies under 

the tree. Kaleah Lemaster, 8
Crystal & Kyle Lemaster
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
For Christmas, I want an Xbox 
360, Wii, two new tablets and 
tablet charges. One is for my 
sister, Lacey and one is for 
me. Allen Tipton, 6
Stevie & Kristi Tipton
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I want a Barbie dream house, 
Barbie Skipper, and a Shop-
kins. And a hair stuff lip gloss.
Mariah Smith, 6
Crystle Smith & David Smith
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I have been good this year. 
I want Pokemon cards, nerf 
machine gun, Flash & King 
shark toy, and the Mario 
game. I would also like the 
joker and Harley Quinn car. 
I will leave you cookies and 
milk. I will leave Rudolph a 
cookie too.
Daxton Harrison, 6
Greg and Courtney Harrison
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I feel like I’ve been a pretty 
good boy this year. I’ve tried 
anyway. I’d really like a Bat-
man mas, Mario Sunshine, 
Windwalker and superman 
video games, I’d also like 
to have a Mario Monopoly 
games since my little brother 
keeps losing all the pieces 
to the one I have now. If you 
have time maybe you could 
bring his own this time.
Love, Keegan Combs, 6
Lauren Cornett
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I would like to have a remote 
control race car with a track 
and two cards for Christmas. 
Thank you, Connor May, 7
Michael May
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I want a lawn mower, toy 
tractors, Xbox one, Elf on 
the Shelf, tool set, and fake 
glasses.
Joseph Harrison, 6
Nancy Ballard
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I have been really good this 
year. I would like a Mario 
playset with figurines or a 
Nintendo switch with Mano 
Odyssey. Please bring my 
brother, Kizer, and my baby 
sister Kora something! Thank 
you!  Kipton Lee, 6
Kris & Amber Lee
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I would like to have an Ameri-
can Girl Doll and scooter, 
and money to buy other kids 
presents that they ask for. I 
will leave you cookies under 
the tree. I love you Santa.
Bella Rogers, 6
Fred Rogers Jr.
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I have been a good girl this 
year. I would like the fol-
lowing items for Christmas: 
Snuggie tale, JoJo backpack, 
JoJo the doll, a Hatchimals 
playset, and Nintendo 3 DS.
McKinnley, 6, Robbie & Steph-
anie Townsend
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
For Christmas, I would like a 
bike, a tablet, Blake Shelton 
CD, Happy Place Drive-Thru, 
and the cars, roller skates, 
and sun glasses. Ava Walling, 
7, Teresa Walling
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I have been a good girl this 
year and all I want is some 
new books to read before I go 
to bed.  Brooklyn Henry, 7
Jennifer & Timothy Johnson
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I would like a Nintendo 
switch and a new tablet and 
some new boots. I will leave 
you some milk and cookies.
Branson King, 6
Cindy Reed & B.J. King
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I would like to have a bicycle, 
a big John Deere Gator and 
some farm animals, but 
anything is okay. I will be 
thankful. Matthew Tipton, 7
Charles and Heather Tipton
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I would like to have a Paw 
Patrol Sea Patroller and Paw 

Patron backpack. I would also 
like to have a basketball and 
a hoop, and some new boots. 
I think I’ve been good this 
year. I will leave you milk and 
cookies under the tree and 
oats for Rudolph. I love you, 
Santa. Kameron Camden, 5
Chris & Ashley Camden
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I hope you’re well. I would 
like 4 Roblox mini figures, 
Lego BB8, and a heavy assault 
walker. I would like a human 
fall flat for PS4. Thank you.
Kaden Thacker, 8, Gerald 
Thacker & Kaisee Fielder
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
My name is James Harlow. 
For Christmas I would like 
some videogames and x-box 
live. I would like my own 
phone too. I want a new 
backpack from Denis Dailey 
on you tube. Can you bring 
something for my mom? 
My mom is the best mom. 
She cooks and hugs me all 
the time. My mom loves me 
more than anyone so bring 
my mom something.  James 
Harlow, 7, Kelley Harlow
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
Raw Wrestling Ring, two 
more wrestlers for my ring, 
Boss Baby DVD, winter 
clothes, a stork DVD, and 
some art supplies are things 
I’d really love for Christmas. 
Could you bring my brother a 
wagon I can ride him around 
in? Thank you Santa. I love 
you. Kristopher McQueen, 6
Heather Philhower, Chris 
Mullins
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I have been a good girl this 
year. I would like to have 
make up for my face and 
some new coloring books 
and crayons. I would also 
like a new rain jacket and 
rain boots, Hatchable and a 
surprise puppy, and one last 
thing, an American Girl doll.
Kaylee Freeman, 6
Brandon & Betty Freeman
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
For Christmas I would like 
a gymnastic bar, a kitten, a 
gymnastic gym nastic bar, 
and a doggie doo doo and a 
batch of slime.
Aubrey, 7
Kevin and Constance Begley
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I would like to have some 
enchantimals, a play kitchen 
and play food that I can cut 
up like real food. Thank you.
I want a tablet. I also want 
a nerf gun. I want a dream 
tent. I will leave you milk and 
cookies on the counter. And 
bring my big bubby a bionical 
Lego set.  Tanner Gilbert, 7
Ashley Abney
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
My name is Chris. I’ve been a 
very good boy this year. For 
Christmas I would like a toy 
robot, a big stuffed animal 
and the operation game. I’ll 
have two cookies under my 
tree for you. Chris Stone, 6
Chris Stone & Alicia Dixon
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I would like a doll. I would 
like a dog and a Hatchimal.
Hailey Rogers, 8
Ashley Rogers & Steve Norton
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I know you have a lot of hous-
es to go to but I only want five 
things so far. I would like a 
Hatchimal, a big golden LOL 
doll, a kiddy phone, an Ipod, 
and a Baby Born. It is okay if 
you can’t find these things but 
if you can’t I will take another 
toy in its place. I hope you 
have a good Christmas and 
remember the true meaning 
of Christ-mas – Jesus!
Love, Havyn Reynolds, 7
Brad & Jennifer Reynolds
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I am Brock and I have been 
a pretty good boy this year.  I 
would like a phone, Pokemon 
cards, megablocks, drone, 
army men, hot wheels, and a 
security camera. Thank you.
Love, Brock Newton, 5
Stephanie & Marty Newton
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 

This year I have been a good 
boy. Would you please bring 
me a RC car, remote control 
boat and a spiderman watch? 
I love you, Santa. You hae a 
cool belt and hat! I will leave 
you milk and cookies beside 
the tree.  Don’t forget my 
sissy’s presents.
Hayden Brooks, 5
Kenneth & Heather Brooks
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
Have I been good this year? I 
have tried to be good. Could 
you please bring me Sponge 
Bob toys, glove world, Barbie 
dentist, Barbie doctor, super 
girls, and a baby sister? I will 
leave you some Oreo cookies 
and milk.
Love, Lyza Walker, 5
Shaye & Jeremy Walker
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I love you very much. I’ve 
tried to be good this year. I 
would like a big Hatchimal, a 
stuffed Rudolph, a pet puppy, 
and an egg that turns into a 
dinosaurus. Love, Madilyn 
Reed
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
All I want for Christmas 
is a monster truck and an 
X-box one, remote control 
truck, and a tablet, and some 
clothes. Trenton Hafley, 8
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I’ve been a really good boy 
this year. I would like to 
have a mini gun, motorcycle 
with helmet, X-box One with 
games and Legos. Please no 
clothes! I will leave you milk 
and cookies and reindeer 
food for Rudolph and the 
others. Thank you and Merry 
Christmas! Dylan Cole Hix, 8
David Hix & Jamie Friend  
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I want a pink smart watch, a 
classic blue tablet, a Luvabella 
doll, doll clothes, a Barbie 
dreamhouse, gymnastics 
Barbie, a make-up set, and 
an ice cream set. I have been 
a good girl every single day. 
I will also leave you cookies 
and milk.  Paxton Bingham, 5
Justin & Crissy Bingham
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I would like a hover board, 
LOL dolls and pets, Grossery 
Gang toys, Pop Tox, Pikmi 
Pops, Baby Alive doll and a 
Gizmo Kids watch. Thank 
you. Soraya Carpenter, 7
Starr Greene & Brad Smith
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I’ve been very good girl today. 
I wish to have a Lego hose 
pool. I hope you will have a 
happy day. Love you.
Jamia
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I would love to have a double 
Hatchimals shopkins jet, 
Lego hospital, American Girl 
doll stuff, Barbie house, Nerf 
Gun, art set, a lava lamp and 
Northern Lights.  Kylynn
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I want a TV and a tablet and 
hunting boots for Christmas. 
Thank you. Braxton Griffith, 5
Brittany Hoover & Rufus 
Griffith
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I hope you have had a good 
year and I am ready for you 
to bring me some presents 
this and the thing I want for 
Christmas is more squishers, 
more makeup, more toys, 
and more ruffled clothes 
for Christmas! Thank you, 
Santa. I love you, Santa. Kaylix 
Dixon, 7, Melissa Dixon & 
Jeremy Dixon.
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I would like a really BIG 
mater two truck and BiG 
Lightning McQueen car. 
Please bring my big brother, 
Kipton, and my baby sister, 
Kora, something too. Thank 
you. Kizer Lee, 4
Kris & Amber Lee
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I want a big blue Nerf gun 
and scope, a new phone, a 
PS4, some games, water gun 
and drill. My sister, Addilynn, 
wants a doll and stroller. 
Thanks. Tyler Barnes, 4
Tamara Thomas

My name is Kenzley Johnson. 
I have been a very good girl 
this year. I would like for you 
to bring me a Barbie house, 
a doll, all my bath stuff, new 
jeans and boots. I have one 
sister named Kamryon. Bring 
her something too – a horse 
for my Barbie.  I will leave 
cookies and milk. Kenzley 
Johnson, 4, Brandon Johnson 
& Meghan Neal
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I like teen titans. Thank you. 
I also want a new ornament 
for the Christmas tree.
Liam Bebout, 3
Elisabeth & Charles Bebout
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I would like some boots and 
some toy cards, also would 
like new sheets and curtains 
for my bedroom.
Triston Horn, 4
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I want a big truck, dump 
truck, DVD movies, and 
clothes size 4T. Trenton Shul-
er, 4, Daniel & April Shuler
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I have been a good girl this 
year! I really want some 
toys. I love you! I would like 
to have a washing machine 
and dryer for my baby dolls. 
I want a toy tree house to 
play with too. I will leave you 
some cookies and milk.
Kambree Quinn Newton, 3
Seth and Toni Newton
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I’m so happy that you are 
coming! I always like the 
presents you bring me! I’ve 
been a good girl and I’ve 
worked hard this whole 
year! I would like to get the 
Shopkins plane with Skyanna, 
Shopkins World Vacation 
movie, a Happy Places house, 
a hula hoop, Lego friends, 
L.O.L. dolls, and some games. 
My brothers want some stuff 
too. Have a good trip around 
the world! Thank you for 
everything! Kaleea Greer, 4
Amber Bray
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I would like a reindeer, a 
horse, puppy, pen for puppy, 
baby doll and cowgirl boots. I 
also want a real baby pig.
I’ve been a very good girl!
Raelyn Snowden, 3, Laura 
Freeman & Craig Snowden
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I want a baby doll, please. I 
would also like a Tiana doll 
Bring Bub a dump truck. I 
have been good this year. I 
will leave you cookies and 
milk and carrots for the 
reindeer. I want to see Mrs. 
Claus too.
Love, Brylee Kate Hobbs, 5
Brandon & Micha Hobbs
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I really want the Batman 
robot and Christmas tree for 
outside. I have been a very 
good boy! I will leave you 
milk and cookies.
Love, Garrett Mays, 4
Kevin & Brooke Mays
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I want a dump truck, a dig-
ger, and a big black truck. 
And bring my sisters some 
presents too. I also want a 
treasure chest. Thank you.
Sawyer Flynn, 4
Bobby & Kim Flynn
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I have been a pretty good 
girl this year. I would like to 
get Doc McStuffin, Shopkins, 
Baby Alive doll, make-up, and 
Frozen stuff. I will leave you 
some milk and cookies too.
Nevaeh Hall, 4, Michelle Hall
-----------------------------
Dear Santa, 
I have been good all year and 
I am going to school now. I’d 
like to be a blue Mustang, 
police car, new pair of boots. 
My teachers have been good 
too so bring them something 
too. My cooks are nice too, 
and don’t forget Mr. Willis. He 
is a very nice person, and my 
brother and sister, and my 
grandma. Merry Christmas.
Hunter Ray Fugate, 4
Charmaine Brinegar


